
ensures  your  investment  translates  into  healthy,
marketablefish.

SimpleSteps,BigResults

«'..FeedingFrequeney

Foroptimalgrowth,feedyourfishconsistently,3
timesaday.Thisregularfeedingscheduleensures
asteadysupplyofnutrients,supportingtheirrapid
growthduringthegrow-outstages.
•...FeedingAmount

Offer  your  fish  3-5%  of their  body  weight  in
GOLD+feedeachday.Adjustthisamountbasedon
their growth and appetite to ensure they receive
sufficientnutritionwithoutoverfeeding.

WhyGOLD+isthewinningchoice

RESHMEEN   GOLD+   is   backed   by   rigorous
researchanddevelopment,ensuringahigh-quality
feed that supercharges the growth and health of
your fish during the crucial grow-out stages. It is
the   winning   choice   for   farmers   seeking
exceptional  results  and  a  strong  retun  on  their
investment.  With  its  tailored nutrition,  extended
feeding  time,  high  palatability,  and  impressive
feedconversionratio,GOLD+setsyourfishupfor
success.
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SustainableSolutions,NutritiousResults

Byrecognizingthevalueofsilkwormpupaemeal
(SWPM), a by-product of silk production, we've
developed  a  sustainable  and nutritious  solution.
With India being the second-largest silk producer,
generatingaround75,000tonsofswpMarmually,
wesawanopportunitytocreatesomethingspecial.
SWPM is naturally rich in protein and essential
nutrients,  making  it  ideal  for  producing  high-
quality   floating   fish   feed   through   extrusion
technology.

TheGrow-OutAdvantage

The grow-out stages of Carp, Pangas, and Tilapia
are  critical   for  their  overall  productivity  and
market value.  Getting the nutrition right during

Experimental Cages at Maithon Dam
I,,,`i.,,i

Release of Souvenir during
National Symposium on Vanya Sericulture: Opportunities Galore

thisperiodisthekeytounlockingtheirfullgrowth

potential. RESHMEEN GOLD+ is designed to be
the secret weapon for this crucial stage, ensuring
yourfishreachtheirmaximunpotential.

UnlockingthepowerofGOLD+

•...TatloredNutritionf:orGrow-Out

GOLD+ offers a protein level of 28% and a lipid
content  of  5%,  specifically  formulated  for  the
unique  needs  of grow-out  stages.  This  tailored
formulationensuresthatyourfishreceivetheright
balance of nutrients for healthy, efficient growth.
TheproteinandlipidlevelsinGOLD+arecarefully
adjusted   to   meet   the   changing   nutritional
requirements of fish during the grow-out stages.
As fish transition from juveniles to adults, their
protein requirements may decrease slightly, while
theirneedforenergy-providinglipidsincreases.

- - `-- `•...ExtendedFeeding,iv[aximizedGrowth

GOLD+isdesignedwithawaterstabilityofover3
hours,givingyourfishextratimetofeedandfully
absorb essential nutrients. This extended feeding
window   ensures   consistent   growth   without
missing any meals, leading to optimal growth and
development. Water stability is a critical factor in
fish feed,  especially during the grow-out stages
when  fish  are  actively  growing  and  require  a

steady  supply  of  nutrients.  GOLD+'s  extended
feeding   time   maximizes   nutrient   absorption,
supportinghealthygrowth.

•...Palatabtlity,theGameChanger

Ourfeedisdesignedwithhighpalatabilityinmind,
encouraging  enthusiastic  feeding  behavior.  This
simple   yet   powerful   strategy   improves   feed
efficiency and keeps your fish happy and healthy.
Palatability  is not just about taste preference;  it
plays a crucial role in feed efficiency. When fish
eagerlyconsumeGOLD+duetoitsappealingtaste

apd texture, they ingest more nutrients, leading to
improvedgrowthandoverallhealth.

•...FeedEffijlcieney,Supercharged

GOLD+  delivers  an  impressive  feed  conversion
ratio of 1.5-1.7, helping you maximize the reun
on your  feed  investment.  It  efficiently  converts
feed  into  fish  growth,  so  you  see  real,  tangible
resultsintheformofrobust,market-ready fish.

Thefeedconversionratioisakeyindicatoroffeed
efficiency.   GOLD+  impressive  ratio  of  1.5-1.7
means that for every 1.5-1.7 kg of feed, your fish
will galn 1 kg of weight. This efficient conversion
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